2006 IBC
February 12, 2008

Passed: 02/12/08
Published:  02/20/08

ORDINANCE NO. 1918

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 15.12.010 OF THE DERBY
MUNICIPAL CODE, PROVIDING FOR ADOPTION BY REFERENCE
OF THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, PERTAINING TO
THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF MATERIALS,
ERECTION, INSTALLATION ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION,
RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, AND USE OR
MAINTENANCE OF STRUCTURES; AND REPEALING ORIGINAL
SECTION 15.12.010 OF SAID CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF DERBY,
KANSAS:

Section 1. §15.12.010 of the Derby Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

15.12.010 Adoption of 2006 International Building Code; local amendments.

A. The 2006 International Building Code, excluding its several appendices
(the "IBC"), a uniform code prepared by the International Code Council, Inc.,
5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia, 22041, is hereby adopted
by reference and incorporated as an ordinance of the City of Derby, Kansas,
except as specific provisions thereof are hereby amended or repealed. One or
more copies of the IBC shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy,” with all
deleted or amended sections or portions thereof clearly marked to show such
modification, and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance. Such copy
or copies shall be filed with the City Clerk and shall be open and available for
public inspection at all reasonable hours.

B. Section 101.1 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Derby,
Kansas (“City”), and may be hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

C. Section 101.4.1 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.4.1 Electrical. Whenever used in the Building Code, the term “ICC Electrical Code”
shall be construed to mean the currently adopted City of Derby, Kansas electric code,
which shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair, and replacement of electrical
systems, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto.



2006 IBC
February 12, 2008

D. Section 101.4.3 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.4.3 Mechanical. Whenever used in the Building Code, the term “International
Mechanical Code” shall be construed to mean the current City of Derby, Kansas
mechanical code, which shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair, and replacement
of mechanical systems, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances,
including ventilating, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems,
incinerators, and other energy-related systems.

E. Section 101.4.4 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.4.4 Plumbing. Whenever used in the IBC, the term “International Plumbing Code”
shall be construed to mean the current City of Derby, Kansas plumbing code, which shall
apply to the installation, alteration, repair, and replacement of plumbing systems,
equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances; all aspects of medical gas
systems; and all private sewage disposal systems.

F. Section 101.4.6 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.4.6 Fire prevention. Whenever used in the Building Code, the term “International
Fire Code” shall be construed to mean the current City of Derby, Kansas fire code, which
shall apply to matters affecting or relating to protection of structures, processes and
premises from fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling or use of structures,
materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the
occupancy of structures or premises; and from the construction, extension, repair,
alteration or removal of fire suppression and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure
or on the premises from occupancy or operation.

G. Section 102.6 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of
adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is
specifically covered in this code or the International Fire Code, or when application of
this code is deemed necessary by the building official for the safety and welfare of the
occupants and the public.

H. Section 103.3 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with procedures prescribed by the City of Derby, Kansas,
and with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the building official shall have the
authority to appoint a deputy building official, the related technical officers, inspectors,
plan examiners and other employees. Such employees shall have those powers delegated
by the building official.

L Sections 105.1.1 and 105.1.2 of the IBC are hereby deleted.



J.

2006 IBC
February 12, 2008

Section 105.2 of the IBC is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. An exemption from permit requirements of this code
shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in
violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of the City.
Building permits shall not be required for the following:

L.

2.
3.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses
and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet (11 mz).

Oil derricks.

Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding Class L, I or IIIA liquids.

Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons
(18 925 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2:1.
Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade,
and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.
Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.
Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy that are less than
24 inches (610 mm) deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons (18 925 L) and are installed
entirely above ground.

Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not including
service systems. :

Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-family
dwellings.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54
inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support of
Group R-3 and U occupancies.

Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9
inches (1753mm) in height.

Interior platforms not over 200 square feet (18.58 m?) in area, nor more than 30
inches (762 mm) above the adjacent floor.

Exterior decks, stoops and porches not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade
without overhead structures and not over any basement or story below.

Emergency board-up or securing of a building and installing temporary bracing after
a fire, storm, vehicle damage or other disaster, which caused the building to be open
or unsafe.

Repair or replacement roofing or siding materials not exceeding 400 square feet
(37.16 m®).

Repair or replacement of interior gypsum wallboard on non-fire rated walls or ceiling
when the total area does not exceed 100 square feet (9.29 m?), and provided that no
framing, electrical, mechanical or plumbing changes are made.



